Section Sect	2022 Crackfill, Sealcoat & Striping at Multiple Locations												
March Marc		Pavement Systems	Denler Inc.	Lakewood Paving Company		SKC Construction	S&R Sealcoating LLC	Maul Enterprises Inc.					
Secretary Secr	BID BOND	X	X	X Base Bid	Cashier's Check	X	X	X					
Manual Sanders Manu													
Sementarisarisaris and sementaris (1998) (19													
Section Sect													
Section Sect	Tarconite Coats : Cost/Sq Foot							\$0.083					
Secure Montage March Mar	Tarconite Coats : 92,453 sq ft							\$7,627.37					
Part		\$4.00	\$5.00	\$8.35	\$2.00	\$12.00	\$4.00	\$3.00					
Common Marking Marker Ma	Pavement Markings : 258 stalls	\$1,032.00	\$1,290.00	\$2,154.30	\$516.00	\$3,096.00	\$1,032.00	\$774.00					
Second	Pavement Markings : cost/HC Spaces	\$75.00	\$15.00	\$63.00	\$15.00	\$42.50	\$50.00	\$45.00					
Common National Process 1908		\$600.00	\$120.00	\$504.00	\$120.00	\$340.00	\$400.00	\$360.00					
Proposed Many 15-790; 150 Horse 16 19-10 1		\$0.40	\$n 28	\$0.42	\$n.28	\$0.66	\$0.30	\$n.25					
Proposed Markeny 1 Stay Per Composed 15 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10 10			,,,,,,	7.7.1.	Ţ <u></u>	*****	,	7					
Section Continue	Feet	\$116.00	\$81.20	\$121.80	\$82.00	\$191.40	\$87.00	\$72.50					
Second Manager Second Se	Pavement Markings : Stop Pad : cost/pad	\$1.50	\$20.00	\$55.25	\$15.00	\$42.00	\$40.00	\$20.00					
March Marc	Pavement Markings : 1 stop pad							\$20.00					
Processor Marriage 19-10		\$0.40	\$0.33	\$47.50	\$n.28	\$0.66	\$0.40	\$n.28					
Section Comment Comm													
March Marc		\$38.00	\$31.35	\$47.50	\$27.00	\$62.70	\$38.00	\$26.60					
1975 1976		\$0.20	\$0.28	\$0.37	\$0.28	\$0.51	\$0.40	\$0.26					
	Pavement Markings : 283 hash lines	\$82.40	\$79.24	\$104.71	\$80.00	\$144.33	\$113.20	\$73.58					
Mont and Colon. Confusion Freet	TOTAL : The Club at Prairie Stone	\$13,213.40	\$13,442.17	\$28,203.16	\$9,490.00	\$18,995.32	\$37,573.45	\$11,454.05					
Part and Card 1-S20 In				WILLOW RECREATION	ON CENTER								
Comment Comm	Rout and Clean : Cost/Linear Feet	\$0.375	\$0.330	\$0.960	\$0.380	\$0.520	\$2.000	\$0.500					
Transpire Coasts (Coasting Food 5,000 5,011 5,020 5,02	Rout and Clean : 5,500 lin ft	\$2,062.50	\$1,815.00	\$5,280.00	\$2,090.00	\$2,860.00	\$11,000.00	\$2,750.00					
	Clean Lot : Lump Sum	\$687.50	Inc	\$1,025.00	Inc	\$500.00	\$750.00	Inc					
Parement Markings : Incordinate Parement Markings : 107 Stalls \$1,000 \$1,00	Tarconite Coats : Cost/Sq Foot	\$0.099	\$0.110	\$0.260	\$0.073	\$0.130	\$0.250	\$0.083					
Processed Markings 107 Aulis 521200 535300 531117 521400 512400 512400 53200		\$4,536.00	\$5,005.00	\$11,830.00	\$3,322.00	\$5,915.00	\$11,375.00	\$3,753.75					
Payment Morking: 1007/RC (places \$75.00 \$31.00 \$77.00 \$31.00 \$41.50 \$50.00 \$40.								\$3.00					
Personal Markings in Kupaton \$15.00 \$15.00 \$15.00 \$25.00		\$428.00	\$535.00	\$1,111.73	\$214.00	\$1,284.00	\$428.00	\$321.00					
Powerment Markings: void/finisher Same		\$75.00	\$15.00	\$77.50	\$15.00		\$50.00	\$45.00					
Second Markings : 25 in it walkway		\$375.00	\$75.00	\$387.50	\$75.00	\$212.50	\$250.00	\$225.00					
1701 1701		\$1.36	\$0.33	\$0.69	\$0.28	\$0.66	\$2.00	\$0.64					
	Pavement Markings : 55 lin ft walkway	475.00	440.45	427.0F	445.00	425.20	4440.00	425.20					
Secret FAMILY AQUATIC CENTER South and Clean Cost/Linear Feet \$0.375 \$0.330 \$1.500 \$0.300 \$0.50	TOTAL : Willow Recreation Center												
Rout and Clean : 3,100 lin ft		φο)20-1100	<i>ψ1)1-10.123</i>			\$20,007.00	Ç23,313.00	\$7,004.55					
Bout and Clean: 3,100 lin ft S1,162.50 S1,023.00 S4,886.00 S1,178.00 S1,612.00 S6,200.00 S1,550.00 Clean text: Lump Sum S487.50 Inc S1,025.00 Inc S500.00 S750.00 Inc Transcribe Coals: Clearly Sept. Of S0,008 S0,010 S2,020 S0,007 S0,130 S0,235 S0,008 S1,000 S1,000 S1,000 S27,675.00 S9,038.71 S1,000 S27,675.00 S1,000 S27,675.00 S1,000 S1,00	Rout and Clean : Cost/Linear Feet	\$0.375	\$0.330	\$1,560	\$0.380	\$0.520	\$2,000	\$0.500					
Clan Lot Lump Sum \$387.50 nc \$5,000 \$750.00 nc \$750.	Rout and Clean : 3,100 lin ft												
Tarconite Coast : 107,700 of ft \$9,867.00 \$12,177.00 \$23,247.00 \$8,081.00 \$14,391.00 \$27,675.00 \$9,131.77	Clean Lot : Lump Sum												
Payment Markings: cost/stall S.4.35 S.5.00 S.9.97 S.2.00 S.1.2.00 S.4.00 S.3.00 S.3.								\$0.083					
Payment Markings: 235 stalls S1,012.00 S1,175.00 S2,342.95 S470.00 S2,820.00 S940.00 S705.00 S705.00 S2,820.00 S940.00 S705.00 S45.00 S45	·							\$9,132.75					
Pavement Markings : cost/InC Spaces			•										
Pavement Markings : PHC Spaces \$525.00 \$105.00 \$518.49 \$105.00 \$297.50 \$350.00 \$310.00 \$310.00 \$297.50 \$350.00 \$31													
Pavement Markings : Stripe : Cost/Linear Feet So.10 So.28 So.52 So.28 So.66 So.30 So.22 So.28 So.67 So.20 So.22 So.2								\$45.00					
Parement Markings : Stripe : 240 Linear S24,00 S67,20 S124,80 S68,00 S158,40 S72,00 S67,20 S6	Pavement Markings : Stripe : Cost/Linear												
Pavement Markings : Stop line : cost/linear feet	Pavement Markings : Stripe : 240 Linear	30.10	ŞU.28	,JU.52	30.28	ŞU.00	ŞU.3U	,JU.28					
feet \$2.36 \$1.50 \$0.51 \$1.00 \$3.50 \$2.00 \$0.55 Pavement Markings : 125 lin ft \$2.95.50 \$187.50 \$63.75 \$125.00 \$437.50 \$25.00 \$62.51 Pavement Markings : walkway : cost/linear foot \$1.11 \$0.33 \$0.42 \$0.28 \$3.50 \$4.70 \$0.28 Pavement Markings : walkway : cost/linear foot \$1.50.00 \$31.35 \$39.90 \$19.00 \$332.50 \$446.50 \$26.66 Pavement Markings : Shi fit walkway \$105.00 \$15.00 \$25.30 \$15.00 \$34.25 \$35.00 \$22.00 Pavement Markings : Shi fit walkway \$48.00 \$15.00 \$25.30 \$15.00 \$44.25 \$35.00 \$22.00 Pavement Markings : Shi fit walkway \$48.00 \$15.00 \$25.30 \$15.00 \$44.25 \$35.00 \$22.00 Pavement Markings : Shi fit walkway \$48.00 \$15.00 \$12.50 \$12.00 \$21.20 \$17.00 \$21.20 \$22.00 \$22.00 \$22.00 \$22.00 \$22.00 \$22.00	Feet	\$24.00	\$67.20	\$124.80	\$68.00	\$158.40	\$72.00	\$67.20					
Pavement Markings : walkway : cost/linear foot S1.11 S0.33 S0.42 S0.28 S3.50 S4.70 S0.28 S3.70 S2.70 S3.70 S3.	feet	\$2.36	\$1.50	\$0.51	\$1.00	\$3.50	\$2.00	\$0.50					
Face		\$295.50	\$187.50	\$63.75	\$125.00	\$437.50	\$250.00	\$62.50					
Pavement Markings : turn arrow :		\$1.11	\$0.33	\$0.42	\$0.28	\$3.50	\$4.70	\$0.28					
Pavement Markings : turn arrow :	Pavement Markings : 95 lin ft walkway	\$105.00	\$31.35	\$39.90	\$19.00	\$332.50	\$446.50	\$26.60					
Pavement Markings : 5 arrows													
TOTAL : Seascape Family Aquatic Center \$13,618.50 \$14,841.05 \$33,224.39 \$10,121.00 \$20,770.15 \$36,858.50 \$11,969.05 \$11,9								\$110.00					
Sample S	TOTAL : Seascape Family Aquatic Center												
Rout and Clean : 2,500 lin ft \$1,250.00 \$825.00 \$3,375.00 \$950.00 \$1,300.00 \$5,000.00 \$1,250.00		\$13,018.50	\$14,841.05			\$20,770.15	\$30,858.50	\$11,909.05					
S1,250.00 S2,250.00 S3,275.00 S950.00 S1,300.00 S5,000.00 S1,250.00	Rout and Clean : Cost/Linear Feet	\$0.500	\$0.330	\$1.350	\$0.380	\$0.520	\$2.000	\$0.500					
Sag	Rout and Clean : 2,500 lin ft	\$1,250.00	\$825.00	\$3,375.00	\$950.00	\$1,300.00	\$5,000.00	\$1,250.00					
Rout and Clean : Cost/Linear Feet \$0.500 \$0.330 \$1.230 \$0.380 \$0.520 \$2.000 \$0.500 Rout and Clean : 2,800 lin ft \$1,400.00 \$924.00 \$3,444.00 \$1,064.00 \$1,456.00 \$5,600.00 \$1,400.00 TOTAL : Victoria South \$1,400.00 \$924.00 \$3,444.00 \$1,064.00 \$1,456.00 \$5,600.00 \$1,400.00 TOTAL BASE BID \$37,645.90 \$37,480.37 \$87,918.73 \$27,342.00 \$53,292.27 \$108,944.95 \$33,158.01 Night Work Additional No bid \$5,000.00 \$25,650.00 \$1,500.00 \$1,000.00 \$2,250.00 \$4,000.00	TOTAL : Victoria North	\$1,250.00	\$825.00			\$1,300.00	\$5,000.00	\$1,250.00					
Rout and Clean : 2,800 lin ft \$1,400.00 \$924.00 \$3,444.00 \$1,064.00 \$1,456.00 \$5,600.00 \$1,400.00 \$70TAL : Victoria South \$1,400.00 \$924.00 \$3,444.00 \$1,064.00 \$1,456.00 \$5,600.00 \$1,400													
TOTAL Victoria South \$1,400.00 \$924.00 \$3,444.00 \$1,064.00 \$1,456.00 \$5,060.00 \$1,400.00 TOTAL BASE BID \$37,645.90 \$37,480.37 \$87,918.73 \$27,342.00 \$53,329.27 \$108,944.95 \$33,158.00 Night Work Additional No bid \$5,000.00 \$2,5650.00 \$1,500.00 \$1,000.00 \$2,250.00 \$4,000.00								\$0.500 \$1,400.00					
Night Work Additional No bid \$5,000.00 \$25,650.00 \$1,500.00 \$2,250.00 \$4,000.00								\$1,400.00					
Night Work Additional No bid \$5,000.00 \$25,650.00 \$1,500.00 \$2,250.00 \$4,000.00	TOTAL BASE BID												
55,000.00 \$23,030.00 \$1,300.00 \$20,000.00 \$2,230.00 \$4,000.00								\$33,158.05					
· ····································	Might Work Auditional	NO bid	\$5,000.00	\$25,650.00 Alternates		\$10,000.00	\$2,250.00	\$4,000.00					

			BRIDGES DRIVING	RANGE			
Rout and clean : cost/linear feet	\$0.50	\$0.33	\$2.32	\$0.38	\$0.52	\$2.00	\$0.50
Rout and clean : 2,000 linear feet	\$1,000.00	\$660.00	\$4,640.00	\$760.00	\$1,040.00	\$4,000.00	\$1,000.0
Tarconite : cost/sq feet	\$0.12	\$0.11	\$1.18	\$0.20	\$0.13	\$0.30	\$0.50
Tarconite : 4,000 sq. ft	\$480.00	\$440.00	\$4,720.00	\$800.00	\$520.00	\$1,200.00	\$2,000.00
Pavement Markings : cost/stall	\$4.00	\$5.00	\$9.11	\$2.00	\$12.00	\$7.14	\$6.0
Pavement Markings : 35 stalls yellow							
square	\$140.00	\$175.00	\$318.85	\$70.00	\$420.00	\$250.00	\$210.00
Pavement Markings : cost/stall	\$5.23	\$2.00	\$9.11	\$2.00	\$12.00	\$7.14	\$6.00
Pavement Markings : 35 stalls yellow	\$183.00	\$70.00	\$318.85	\$70.00	\$420.00	\$250.00	\$210.00
Bridges Driving Range	\$1,803.00	\$1,345.00	\$9,997.70	\$1,700.00	\$2,400.00	\$5,700.00	\$3,420.00
	, ,	, ,	HUNTINGTON PARK		,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,	,,,	,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,
Rout and clean : cost/linear feet	\$0.38	\$0.40	\$3.74	\$0.38	\$0.52	\$2.00	\$0.50
Rout and clean: 1,000 linear feet	\$375.00	\$400.00	\$3,740.00	\$380.00	\$520.00	\$2,000.00	\$500.00
Clean Lot : Lump Sum	\$125.00	\$200.00	\$1,150.00	Inc	\$500.00	\$500.00	Inc
Tarconite : cost/sq feet	\$0.12	\$0.11	\$0.82	\$0.20	\$0.13	\$0.30	\$0.18
Tarconite : 5,685 sq. ft	\$656.00	\$625.35	\$4,661.70	\$1,137.00	\$739.05	\$1,705.50	\$1,023.30
Pavement Markings : cost/stall	\$4.00	\$10.00	\$12.50	\$3.00	\$12.00	\$10.00	\$10.00
Pavement Markings : 17 stalls	\$68.00	\$170.00	\$212.50	\$51.00	\$204.00	\$170.00	\$170.00
Pavement Markings : cost/HC Spaces	\$75.00	\$15.00	\$106.25	\$15.00	\$42.50	\$100.00	\$45.00
Pavement Markings : 2 HC Spaces	\$150.00	\$30.00	\$212.50	\$30.00	\$85.00	\$200.00	\$90.00
Pavement Markings : Stripe : Cost/Linear Feet	\$0.65	\$0.50	\$5.31	\$0.28	\$0.51	\$1.00	\$0.50
Pavement Markings : Stripe : 40 Linear Feet	\$26.00	\$20.00	\$212.50	\$12.00	\$20.40	\$40.00	\$20.00
Huntington Parking Lot	\$1,400.00	\$1,445.35	\$10,189.10	\$1,610.00	\$2,068.45	\$4,615.50	\$1,803.30
Total Cost of Alternates	\$3,203.00	\$2,790.35	\$20.186.80	\$3,310.00	\$4,468,45	\$10,315.50	\$5,223.30